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Gleam: The Plated Prisoner, the first installment in Raven Kennedy's
captivating Plated Prisoner series, transports readers to a realm where the
battle between good and evil rages fiercely. Follow the extraordinary
journey of Auren, a young woman who is captured and enslaved by a cruel
king. But even in the depths of despair, Auren's indomitable spirit shines
brightly.
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A Heroine of Unwavering Determination

Auren is a character you won't soon forget. Despite the unimaginable
horrors she endures, her resilience and determination never waver. As she
fights to regain her freedom and navigate the treacherous court of her
captor, Auren proves that even in the darkest of places, hope can prevail.

A Complex and Gripping Plot

Gleam: The Plated Prisoner is a masterfully crafted story that will keep you
on the edge of your seat from beginning to end. The novel's intricate plot
unfolds with unexpected twists and turns, leaving you guessing what will
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happen next. As Auren's journey progresses, she uncovers dangerous
secrets and faces choices that will shape her destiny and the fate of her
world.

Ravishing World-Building

Kennedy has created a vibrant and immersive world in Gleam: The Plated
Prisoner. The kingdom of Briseis is a realm of breathtaking beauty and
ancient mysteries. From the opulent halls of the palace to the dangerous
forests that surround it, every setting is meticulously described, transporting
readers to a realm they'll never want to leave.

Unforgettable Characters

Beyond Auren, Gleam: The Plated Prisoner features a cast of unforgettable
characters. From the enigmatic King Lazareth, who holds both Auren and
her freedom captive, to the loyal and enigmatic Jax, who becomes her
unlikely ally, every character is richly developed and brings depth to the
story.

Themes that Resonate

Gleam: The Plated Prisoner explores a range of universal themes that will
resonate with readers of all ages. The novel delves into issues of freedom,
power, and the resilience of the human spirit. Auren's journey becomes a
symbol of hope and inspiration, reminding us that even in the darkest of
times, it is possible to overcome adversity and forge a path of our own.

A Must-Read for Fantasy Lovers

If you're a fan of high-fantasy adventures with strong female characters,
intricate plots, and immersive world-building, then Gleam: The Plated



Prisoner is the book you've been waiting for. Immerse yourself in Raven
Kennedy's captivating saga and embark on a journey that will leave you
spellbound.

Reviews and Accolades

"Gleam: The Plated Prisoner is an epic fantasy that will leave you
breathless. Auren is a fierce and unforgettable heroine, and her journey is
both thrilling and heartbreaking." - Goodreads Reviewer

"Raven Kennedy's writing is both lyrical and gripping. Gleam: The Plated
Prisoner is a must-read for fans of fantasy." - Publishers Weekly

Free Download Now

Don't miss out on the thrilling adventures that await you in Gleam: The
Plated Prisoner. Free Download your copy today and embark on a journey
you'll never forget.
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