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I was born deaf. I didn't know it at the time, of course. I thought everyone
else heard the world the way I did: as a cacophony of sounds that made no
sense.

It wasn't until I was three years old that my parents finally realized that I
wasn't hearing them. They took me to the doctor, who confirmed their fears:
I was deaf.

My parents were devastated. They didn't know how they were going to
raise a deaf child. They didn't know how I was going to learn to
communicate. They didn't know how I was going to live a normal life.

FREE

https://novel.aroadtome.com/read-book.html?ebook-file=eyJjdCI6IkFsaUV6V1ozZXBLMzBRWDBPUE9Oc050cnZkMUJRN2pcLzl4SFNCa3BITmR0Nnc5UThRQmNnM0k5K3Azd3UxXC8xZ281ZzJnek9SM2FxMENVdVdsU09OT2VCVXY1MDJkSStcL3oyZW5XdXF2TENIaStsUEE3dDJYXC96Ykk3V2lwOFwvbFZ4bmR2TndJa2xwbmR0am5ZcHVVYnFvd2tnMFwvUzF6c0lSSmFaanRFczMzST0iLCJpdiI6ImRjMmU4MmMzZmU1ZGI2YmY2OGYwNjViOWIwZDY1N2I2IiwicyI6IjZiZGU4YzljMGZhMzY4NmIifQ%3D%3D
https://novel.aroadtome.com/read-book.html?ebook-file=eyJjdCI6Ik5ibStrRW5UU2hXR20zeW1sOTNqTm9JOXQ5U21GVEFKTGpScGt0Tm1odVRmWWlLRjh6Tm5tdzJjR0p6c2hzcEp2bEtLVTVqYWF3azJcLzFWMFB2eEVZOWl3VFg2cG1LZ3ZDdjJ6b3VFZkdTVUZnbTdLOVFHWnRNeXYyNis4N3FzZVhNdFJtZHJyZkJCcWpveGlucjN6dUU3RFVyN2pEZER0RVFxTzhoODlnTm89IiwiaXYiOiI0NDRhNDZmMDgxNWM3YjY4YzhlYTYyMTg2YzcwOTdjOSIsInMiOiJjZmY4NjlmYjczYTBmNzZmIn0%3D
https://novel.aroadtome.com/read-book.html?ebook-file=eyJjdCI6IldXZTh2OU1jQTB1QnFoNW1RS1IxSHpFZk5SS0p4bUZRODFLNnZQZmRwRVA2WFlMTzdBSWtcL3NZUVExRDE5c3hlNXFISTcyaGlCeUYrRXhHbmhjZmNCajBrOFBodDFwTGdQR3Q2eFUyUmVZWGt3Q1hPOWJXdURSeFVzRThrN1l3S3F6cUd5amRkajhCSUNORDU4SE1jUjdqWHY2eSthQURRdEZWWWJ6NTh4Tm89IiwiaXYiOiJhYmFhOWYyOWFiMWQ0ODlmYjUwMzM0NDdlMjY2OGJjMiIsInMiOiI4ZTQwZTdiZWY4ZjU5NTU0In0%3D


But my parents didn't give up on me. They enrolled me in a special school
for deaf children, where I learned to communicate using sign language. I
also learned how to read and write, and how to use my other senses to
compensate for my lack of hearing.

As I grew older, I began to realize that my deafness was not a disability. It
was simply a different way of experiencing the world. I learned to embrace
my deafness, and I began to see it as a gift.

I met my husband, John, when I was in college. He was also deaf, and we
immediately bonded over our shared experiences. We fell in love quickly,
and we were married a year later.

John and I have been together for over 20 years now, and we have two
beautiful children. Our lives haven't always been easy, but we've always
faced our challenges together, and we've always come out stronger on the
other side.

Love Falls on Deaf Ears and Hears Clearly is my story. It's a story of love,
loss, and triumph. It's a story about the challenges of being deaf, but it's
also a story about the joy and fulfillment that can be found in life, even
when things don't always go according to plan.

I hope that my story will inspire others who are facing challenges in their
own lives. I hope that it will show them that it is possible to overcome
adversity, and that love can truly conquer all.

Free Download your copy of Love Falls on Deaf Ears and Hears
Clearly today!



**Alt attribute for images:**

* **Image of a woman signing:** A woman with long, dark hair is signing.
She is smiling and looking at the camera. * **Image of a man and woman
signing:** A man and woman are signing to each other. They are both
smiling and laughing. * **Image of a group of deaf children signing:** A
group of deaf children are signing to each other. They are all smiling and
having fun.
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